

TAB 2

Sensenig Law Firm, P.A.

2033 Main Street, Suite 406
Sarasota, FL 34237
P: 941-953-2612 F:941-953-2043
christinersensenig@verizon.net
Federal EIN: 20-0768724

July 30, 2009

BILL FOR LEGAL SERVICES RELATED TO TANYA LUKOWIAK AND CITY OF PALMETTO/PALMETTO CRA

Services provided by the Sensenig Law Firm, P.A., to Tanya Lukowiak

Date	Description	Time
6/18/09	Telephone call with client re: representation for severance agreement; review of internet articles re: situation and persons involved.	.6
6/21/09	Review of tape recording from meeting with S. Churuti which took place on June 16, 2009.	.4
	Receipt and review of emails sent from client including severance agreement, human resources documents, payroll stub, severance calculations & calculation of numbers by hand.	1.8
6/22/09	Voicemail left for client.	.1 NC
	Telephone call with client re: review of agreement.	.3
	Voicemail left for S. Churuti re: Agreement.	.1 NC
	Emails to/from client re: calculations of severance.	.3
6/23/09	Telephone call with S. Churuti re: agreement & changes thereto.	.5
6/24/09	Revisions to agreement & tracking of revisions.	1.3
	Forwarding of revised agreement to client for review.	.1
	Telephone call with client re: review of agreement & re: status	.3

	of discussions with S. Churuti.	
	Receipt and review of comments from client re: areas of concern found in SAR.	.3
6/26/09	Receipt and review of email from client's accountant.	.2
6/28/09	Email from client requesting further revisions & questions as to certain provisions.	.2
6/29/09	Additional revisions to agreement and forwarding of same to client.	.6
	Telephone call with client re: revisions.	.5
	Email to S. Churuti re: revised agreement and request for additional information.	.3
	Email from S. Churuti re: status update/	.1
	Review of North River News Article re: commentary from commissioners re: client.	.3
	Receipt and review of Summary Plan Documents.	.4
	Receipt and review of email from S. Churuti re: receipt of revised SAR.	.1 NC
7/1/09	Receipt and review of email from client re: social security issues.	.2
7/2/09	Email from client re: paid administrative leave.	.1
7/3/09	Email to S. Churuti status of paid administrative leave.	.1
7/4/09	Receipt and review of email from S. Churuti re: administrative leave status.	.1
	Email to client re: administrative leave status & re: tax implications of retirement/pension fund distribution.	.2
7/5/09	Email from client re: leave status.	.2
7/6/09	Telephone call with S. Churuti re: status update.	.3
	Email to S. Churuti re: clarification of status of paid administrative leave, and response from S. Churuti.	.2

7/7/09	Emails from and to client re: return to work & leave status.	.3
	Email from S. Churuti, confirming continued paid administrative leave for client.	.1
7/8/09	Emails to and from client re: continued questions re: paid leave.	.1
7/9/09	Telephone call with S. Churuti re: status update.	.3
	Email from S. Churuti re: retirement eligibility.	.1
	Telephone call to client re: status update from call with S. Churuti.	.2
7/10/09	Telephone call with client re: all aspects of settlement.	1.5
	Email to S. Churuti re: issues from client that remain outstanding for resolution including public commentary; reply from S. Churuti to discuss matter further with City.	.2
7/14/09	Receipt and Review of email from attorney D. Rouson to S. Churuti re: additional concerns.	.1
7/15/09	Email to D. Rouson re: strategy	.2
	Email to S. Churuti re: audit	.1
	Telephone call with S. Churuti & M. Barnebey.	.1
	Email to D. Rouson re: status update	.1
	Receipt and Review of cursory initial review of revised SAR.	.3
	Telephone call with D. Rouson, S. Churuti, & M. Barnebey re: status update.	.4
	Telephone call with client re: status update & review of revised SAR.	.5
	Telephone call with D. Rouson re: insurance coverage issues & League of Cities.	.2
	Telephone call with S. Churuti & M. Barnebey re: mutual non-disparagement.	.2

	Telephone call with S. Churuti, M. Barnebey, & D. Rouson re: settlement terms & issue for future discussions.	.5
	Telephone call with D. Rouson re: strategy.	.2
7/19/09	Email to M. Barnebey re: review of final SAR with client on morning of July 20th.	.1
	Detailed review of SAR and comparison to old SAR.	.9
	Telephone call with client re: changes to SAR & finalizing of agreement.	.4
	Email to M. Barnebey re: review of SAR with client and re: attending City meeting.	.1
7/20/09	Meeting with client to review agreement line by line; discussion of all options.	1.5
	Faxing of SAR and note to Barnebey re: finalizing of agreement.	.2
	Telephone call with S. Churuti re: City Commission/CRA meeting, agenda item unnoticed, & details re: meeting.	.2
	Travel to & from attendance at City meeting.	3.4
	Telephone call with client re: summary of meeting.	.4
7/21/09	Review of online sources re: reporting of severance package	.4 NC
	Reporting of articles & request for information as to settlement check protocol to S. Churuti & M. Barnebey.	.2
7/22/09	Telephone call with client re: payment specifics	.2
	Email from S. Churuti re: status of severance payment.	.1 NC
7/23/09	Review of North River News article re: severance package.	.2 NC
7/24/09	Review of Bradenton Herald article re: severance package	.2 NC
	Email to S. Churuti and M. Barneby re: press releases and gratitude for compliance with non-disparagement portion of SAR.	.1 NC
7/27/09	Email from M. Barnebey re: status of severance check.	.1 NC

8/1/09 Additional internet research re: press related to severance package and CRA. .5 NC

8/15/09 Email to client re: status of distribution of pension check. .1 NC

TOTAL TIME: 19.8

TOTAL TIME "NO CHARGED": 2.00

TOTAL HOURS TO BE BILLED: 17.8

BILLING BREAKDOWN:

Hourly rate: \$300.00 per hour.

$$\$300.00 \times 17.8 \text{ hours} = \$5,340$$

TOTAL FEES FOR THIS MATTER: \$5,340.00

TOTAL COSTS:

All costs waived \$0.00

TOTAL FEES & COSTS FOR ALL MATTERS TO DATE: \$5,340.00

For legal services and costs rendered through August 15, 2009, \$00 is due and owing to the Sensenig Law Firm, P.A. within 30 days of the billing date. Your prompt attention to this matter is appreciated.

Approved for payment
S. H. O. L.
8/26/09