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INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS 
 

These guidelines establish generally acceptable standards.  It should be noted that these standards are 
subject to review and modification by the City Clerk who will assist departments in addressing exposures 
as conditions warrant.  As a result of the review, requirements may be decreased or increased in response 
to specific exposures.  Any deviations from the standards presented in the following paragraphs will be 
documented. These insurance requirements shall in no way limit the liability of the Other Party. The City 
does not represent these minimum insurance requirements to be sufficient or adequate to protect the Other 
Party’s interests or liabilities but are merely minimums. 

“Except for workers’ compensation and professional liability, the Other Party’s insurance policies shall be 
endorsed to name the City of Palmetto as additional insured. It is agreed that the Other Party’s insurance 
shall be deemed primary and non-contributory with respect to any insurance or self-insurance carried by 
The City Palmetto for liability arising out of the operations of this agreement.” 

Except for workers’ compensation, the Other Party waives its right of recovery against the City, to the 
extent permitted by its insurance policies.  

The Other Party’s deductibles/self-insured retentions shall be disclosed to the City and may be disapproved 
by the City. They shall be reduced or eliminated at the option of the City. The Other Party is responsible 
for the amount of any deductible or self-insured retention.  

Insurance required of the Other Party, or any other insurance of the Other Party shall be considered primary, 
and insurance of the City shall be considered excess, as may be applicable to claims which arise out of the 
Hold Harmless, Payment on Behalf of the City of Palmetto, Insurance, Certificates of Insurance and any 
Additional Insurance provisions of this agreement, contract, or lease. 

To aid in the identification of loss exposures, drafts of all bid documents, contracts, franchises, leases, 
permits, use agreements, etc. are to be forwarded to the City Clerk for review prior to bid and/or execution. 

 

MINIMUM INSURANCE REQUIREMENTS 
 

COMMERICAL GENERAL LIABILITY 

This insurance shall be an “occurrence” type policy written in comprehensive form and shall protect the 
Other Party and the additional insured against all claims arising from bodily injury, sickness, disease, or 
death of any person other than the Other Party’s employees or damage to property of the City or others 
arising out of any act or omission of the Other Party or its agents, employees, or Subcontractors and to be 
inclusive of property damage resulting from explosion, collapse or underground (XCU) exposures. This 
policy shall also include protection against claims insured by usual personal injury liability coverage, and 
to insure the contractual liability assumed by the Other Party under the article entitled 
INDEMNIFICATION, and “Products and Completed Operations” coverage.  

The Other Party is required to continue to purchase products and completed operations coverage for a 
minimum of three years beyond the City’s acceptance of renovation or construction properties.  

The liability limits shall not be less than: 

 Bodily Injury and Property Damage:  $1,000,000 single limit each occurrence 
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AUTOMOBILE LIABILITY 

Auto Liability coverage is to include bodily injury and property damage arising out of ownership, 
maintenance, or use of any auto, including owned, non-owned and hired automobiles and employee non-
ownership use.  

The liability limits shall not be less than:  

 Bodily Injury and Property Damage:  $300,000 single limit each occurrence 

 

WORKERS’ COMPENSATION 

Workers’ Compensation coverage to apply for all employees for statutory limits and shall include 
employer’s liability with a limit of $100,000 each accident, $500,000 disease policy limits, $100,000 
disease limit each employee. (“All States” endorsement is required where applicable). If exempt from 
Worker’s Compensation coverage, as defined in Florida Statue 440, the Other Party will provide a copy of 
State Workers’ Compensation exemption. 

All subcontractors shall be required to maintain Worker’s Compensation.  

The Other Party shall also purchase any other coverage required by law for the benefit of employees. 

 
SPECIAL REQUIREMENTS 
 

Twenty (20) days prior to the commencement of any work under this contract a certificate of insurance 
will be provided to the City Clerk for review and approval.  The certificate shall provide the following: 

1. The City of Palmetto will be named as an “Additional Insured” on both the General Liability 
and Automobile Liability policies. 

2. The City of Palmetto will be given thirty (30) days’ notice of prior to cancellations or 
modification of any stipulated insurance.  Such notice will be in writing by certified mail, 
return receipt requested and addressed to the City Clerk. 

An appropriate “indemnification” clause shall be made a provision of the contract. 

It is the responsibility of the Contractor to ensure that all subcontractors comply with all City stipulated 
insurance requirements. 

Please note that these are minimum requirements which are subject to modification in response to high 
hazard operations.  
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ADDITIONAL INSURANCE 
 

PROFESSIONAL LIABILITY/MALPRACTICE/ERRORS OR OMISSIONS INSURANCE 

The Other Party shall carry professional malpractice insurance throughout the term of this Contract and 
shall maintain such coverage for an extended period of three (3) years after completion and acceptance of 
any work performed hereunder. At all times throughout the period of required coverage, said coverage shall 
insure all claims accruing from the first date of the Contract through the expiration date of the last policy 
period. In the event that Other Party shall fail to secure and maintain such coverage, Other Party shall be 
deemed the insurer of such professional malpractice and shall be responsible for all damages suffered by 
the City as a result thereof, including attorney’s fees and costs.  

The liability limits shall not be less than:  $1,000,000 

 
EVIDENCE/CERTIFICATES OF INSURANCE 

 

Required insurance shall be documented in Certificates of Insurance which provide that the City shall be 
notified at least 30 days in advance of cancellation, nonrenewable, or adverse change.  

New Certificates of Insurance are to be provided to the City at least 15 days prior to coverage renewals. 

If requested by the City, the Other Party shall furnish complete copies of the Other Party’s insurance forms 
and endorsements, or mutually agree to a place, time, and location where the City can review the policies 
if needed. 

For Commercial General Liability coverage, the Other Party shall, at the option of the City, provide an 
indication of the amounts of claims payments or reserves chargeable to the aggregate amount of liability 
coverage.  

Receipt of certificates or other documentation of insurance or policies or copies of policies by the City, or 
by any of its representatives, which indicate less coverage than required does not constitute a waiver of the 
Other Party’s obligation to fulfill the insurance requirements herein. 
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